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Name = Sharon Dalrymple
Email Address = dbba23@yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Renee Snyder, Ph.D.
State = California
Email Address = reneesnyderphd@yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Irene Mills
State = Oregon
Email Address = missirene@comcast.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Marcia Peterson
Email Address = nwmarci@ywave.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Dean Haber
State = New Jersey
Email Address = mrshaber(a)comcast.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

How we treat animals is a true measure of our society's values.

Thank you



Name = Eleanor & Harry Gossner
State = New Jersey
Email Address = harry.j.gossner@lmco.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Debbie & Glenn Carson
State = New Jersey
Email Address = dcarson@archerlaw.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = kathy bantivoglio
State = New Jersey
Email Address = kathybcinn@yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Justine Corboy
State = New Jersey
Email Address = jcorboy@aol.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Laurie Johnston
State = California
Email Address = ljohnston@hughes.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Lindsey Irvin
State = Illinois
Email Address = Lirvin24@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Mary Card in
State = PA
Email Address = clcardin@mindspring.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Deb Kulczak
State = Arkansas
Email Address = dkulczak@uark.edu

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Susan Peter-Thompson
Email Address = scrubiavl218(a)vahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Wilma Daubman
State = CA
Email Address = meezrs@sbcglobal.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Shirley Skulski
State = PA
Email Address = kobobs@aol.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Kevin Pat no
State = WY
Email Address = kpatno@bresnan.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Mary Patno
State = WY
Email Address = marypatno@yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Amy Grace
State = Colorado
Email Address = akmvdland(cDiuno.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Michele Lobosco
State = NY
Email Address = lobosco.michele(a)qmail.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Michele Lobosco
State = NY
Email Address = lobosco.michele(a)qmail.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Hana Butter
State = California
Email Address = hanaskids@earthlink.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Vitia Villegas
State = California
Email Address = vitial5@juno.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jennifer Crossey
State = PA
Email Address = jennifercrossey@verizon.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Valerie Musenga
State = New York
Email Address = val@namtitle.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Mari and Dale Christensen
State = NC
Email Address = marbocat@aol.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Barbara Hufnus
State = Illinois
Email Address = bfourdog@aol.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Dominique Allion
State = Illinois
Email Address = ddallion@yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jack Buchheit
State = CO
Email Address = montigrp@att.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Andrea Mekshes
State = California
Email Address = amekshes@yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Irene maracic
State = Illinois
Email Address = iren802@aol,com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = David Patterson
State = Pennsylvania
Email Address = davidp80(a)vahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jamie Hernandez
State = Pennsylvania
Email Address = jamiep27@yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Kelly Shaw
State = Massachusetts
Email Address = iellvbean8376(a)vahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jess Kramer
State = MA
Email Address = jessiel42@teacher.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = DebraTadman
State = California
Email Address = debra.tadman@smusd.org

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Emily Kirkegard
State = New Jersey
Email Address = emlars@optonline.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Rick Abrant
State = IL
Email Address = rma225@aol.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jacob kenna
State = California
Email Address = hippy-goth@hotmail.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Denny Murphy
State = MO
Email Address = snickerbee@charter.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Amy Whiddon
State = MA
Email Address = AWhiddon@MEDITECH.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Lisa Rounds
State = Massachusetts
Email Address = lrounds@meditech.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = JULIE PIERCE
State = MASSACHUSETTS
Email Address = PIERCESP0GS(5)H0TMAILC0M

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Eileen Cillis
State = PA
Email Address = egillis916@yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Ms. Claire Parker
State = New Jersey Proverbs 12.10 A RIGHT5OUS MAN R5GARDS
TH5 L1F5 OF HIS ANIMALS, AND W5 WILL ALL STAND B5FOR5 TH5
LORD JESUS CHRIST ON5 DAY WH5N H5 COM5S, AND THIS
CONC5RNS P5OPL5 AS W5LL STOP MISTR5ATING HIS ANIMALS IN
TH5 NAM5 OF J5SUS!!!!! GOD BL5SS THANKS

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

5very kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Robert & Karen Wilson
State = Pennsylvania
Email Address = rwilson@p4s.org

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Melissa Watters
State = Pennsylvania
Email Address = melissajevy@comcast.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Laura Gibson
State = New Jersey
Email Address = www.luckybirddoq(a)yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = CINA AUSTIN
State = T5NN5SS55
5mail Address = H0NDADRIVR(5)YAH00.C0M

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

5very kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Rosetta Cozart
State = WV
Email Address = wcasrosy(5)rcvideo.com

Message = Please do what is ethically correct for the dogs. Let your
heart be your conscious on this., there is no way to look at it in
anyother light than horrible abuse. Please know that I support the
regulatory changes to the commercial dog regulations submitted by
the Coalition Against Misery. The draft regulations that were
recently released by the Pennsylvania Department of Agriculture do
not adequately address the issues of temperature control, cage
conditions and humane breeding practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you

Rosetta Cozart www.wetzelpets.petfinder.com



Name = Cynthia K Nichols
State = Current WV, native born Pennsylvanian
Email Address = cinandpoms(5)yahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Peggy Wrazen
State = New York
Email Address = boxers4us(5)adelphia.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Anne Flournoy
State = Texas
Email Address = anneteaml@aol.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = DebraJ. Sautner
State = New York
Email Address = symphony39@optonline.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Damon Weber
State = NJ
Email Address = deweber@comcast.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Elizabeth Jonach
State = NJ
Email Address = eevore08733(a)vahoo.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Barbara
State = CT
Email Address = bam592(5)comcast.net

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Mary Wiltshire
State = Brewster New York 10509
Email Address = marywiltshirel964@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Wendy Morgan
State = North Carolina
Email Address = jeffwendy4540@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Joanne raus
State = CT
Email Address = ioanneraus(a)hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Theresa Terhark
State = MN
Email Address = tterhark@msn.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Brenda Bratton
State = Georgia
Email Address = brendabratton(5)vahoo.com

Message = How can the amish possibly provide adequate heat, air
and cleanliness when they have no electricity, no running water.
Please stop overlooking their inadequate care of their dogs based
on their religous issues. They provide the worst care and should be
made to adhere to same standards as every other breeder. But,
sadly they are not. My question is WHY?

I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog regulations
submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft regulations
that were recently released by the Pennsylvania Department of
Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of temperature
control, cage conditions and humane breeding practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Cynthia Montgomery
State = British Columbia
Email Address = indigo-generation@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Shirley Kennedy
State = Georgia

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jo-Ann Freda
State = CT
Email Address = jfredal7@optonline,net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery, The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Lynda Kraft
State = New York
Email Address = acesoharts@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Opal Dobbins
State = Illinois
Email Address = jsplrb2@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Walter R. Dobbins
State = Iowa
Email Address = wblinc89(5)aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Martin Dobbins
State = Iowa
Email Address = deerslayer@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Mary Louise Smith
State = Iowa
Email Address = a224me2dance@msn.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Rachel Teem
State = Iowa
Email Address = rkteem@msn.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Joseph S. Pundzak
State = Iowa
Email Address = jpundzak@msn.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Barbara Dobbins
State = Iowa
Email Address = thimble_mom(a)hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Linda R. Blakely
State = Iowa
Email Address = mstarpro@msn.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Katherine Lishman
State = Penna
Email Address = jckl@verizon.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Janet White
State = North Carolina

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Ruth Abbott
State = Washington
Email Address = reminqton_ahs(a)vahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = June Stewart
State = MA
Email Address = istewart8(5)nvcap.rr.com

Message = I support the regulatory changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

You have made an excellent beginning by taking some steps to end
these inhumane conditions. Please heed the suggestions made by
CAM to improve upon your good work.

Thank you



Name = Linda McCoy
State = Washington
Email Address = llbmccoy@comcast.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Candice Lundquist
State = Arizona
Email Address = PeeperslO@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Greg
State = California
Email Address = punkkid917(5)qmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Will Camacho
State = Delaware
Email Address = wcamacho@bellatlantic.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Sandy Camacho
State = Delaware
Email Address = sbabym@bellatlantic.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Ginger G. Luke
Email Address = gingerluke@comcast.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Karen K. Merrell
State = Indiana
Email Address = kkm33(a)comcast.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that,can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Judy Grastorf
State = NJ
Email Address = WeeGrayMuzzles@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Teri Schlotman
State = KY
Email Address = tschlotman@fuse.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Lisa Scalf
State = Kentucky
Email Address = dscalf@mikrotec.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Arthur Penney
State = New Jersey
Email Address = lslx@bellatlantic.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Cheryl Higdon
State = Kentucky
Email Address = Quaslor@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Robyn Bousum
State = Missouri
Email Address = Robvnl(5)kc.rr.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Cindy Spake
State = Missouri
Email Address = fopas.news(a>hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jacqueline Smith
State = Connecticut
Email Address = smithjx4@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Deborah Smith
State = California
Email Address = debsplay@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Ronda Williams
State = New Jersey
Email Address = rwilliams@bdo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Paula Keehner
Email Address = bkeehner@netins.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Darielle N. D'Angelo
State = NJ
Email Address = rangerspd@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Cindy Alfieri,David Amish.M August
State = NEW YORK
Email Address =
maugust@att.net,cynthia.alfieri(a)verizonbusiness.com,dkamish@sbc
global.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Connie Maedke
State = Wl
Email Address = cmaedke@centurytel.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Laura Brill
State = CA
Email Address = brilllaura@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Mary Gallagher
State = Massachusetts
Email Address = mary.gallagher@schepens.harvard.edu

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Emily Atkins
State = Virginia
Email Address = outer_banks_qirl(a)hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Robin Atkins
State = Virginia
Email Address = myrtlebeachdays@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Joan Hairfield
State = Virginia
Email Address = joanh07@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Denise T. Spors
State = North Carolina
Email Address = beauspors@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Holly Sizemore
State = UT
Email Address = holly@utahpets.org

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Anna Maria Machosky
State = VA
Email Address = aventura@williamswhittle.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = CHRISTINE RYAN
State = ILLINOIS
Email Address = JETSKIGIRL10@AOL.COM

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Lorraine J, Brady
State = Pennsylvania
Email Address = Scruff66@verizon.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Kimberly R. Allen
State = Missouri
Email Address = allenkr67@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Roger Messick
State = Wisconsin
Email Address = director@bayareahumanesociety.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Karen S. King
State = Georgia
Email Address = karenskingl962@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Peggy Nunez
State = New York
Email Address = peqmaster5q(a)yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Courtney Lundquist
State = AZ
Email Address = qdpiel67(5)aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jennifer Knapp
State = NJ
Email Address = jknapp@sas.upenn.edu

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Colleen Noyes
State = Connecticut
Email Address = Ccn21@sbcglobal.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Shelley Zipp
State = Kansas
Email Address = zipp.shellev(a)dol.qov

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = ariana blossom
State = ny
Email Address = arianablossom@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jennifer Mayo
State = North Carolina
Email Address = expatiam@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Debra Denavs
State = Kansas
Email Address = ddenavs@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Patty Galloway
State = North Carolina
Email Address = patty_galloway@nwsco.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Lisa K. Klem
State = Ohio
Email Address = lkklem@msn.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = L Felus.Lora Heller,
Email Address = leefelus@hotmail.com,hellerhome@verizon.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Nancy Brown
State = Texas
Email Address = nancybrown_234@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = LORRAINE VESCE
State = STATEN ISLAND, NY
Email Address = lorraine.m.vesce(S)us.pwc.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Cathryn Brown
State = Texas
Email Address = cbrown3@houstonisd.org

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



ame = Anne
State = New York
Email Address = amcdonalOrdq.boehrinqer-inaelheim.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Fran Townsend
State = New York
Email Address = fvtowns@frontiernet.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Andrea Perchak
State = Connecticut
Email Address = perchak8@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Kuhn, Debbie
State = PA
Email Address = debinerie@msn.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Alyson Rodgerson
State = CT
Email Address = arodgerson@medcononline.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Erin Halsey
State = CT
Email Address = halseye@optonline.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Diana Brady
State = CT
Email Address = dbrady@medcononline.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Nancy Hibbeler
State = Illinois

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Patty Billings
State = Maryland
Email Address = haphorse4@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jennifer Hammitt
State = Connecticut
Email Address = jhammitt79@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = sharon murphy
State = Ireland
Email Address = sportszonetuam@eircom.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Barbara Schiano
State = New York
Email Address = barbaras@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Brandie
State = WA
Email Address = Iaughsalot0579@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Marilyn Augustyn
State = Nebraska
Email Address = mariiauqustvn(a)vahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Adriana Bonsteel
State = Maryland
Email Address = abonstee@wcboe.org

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Dale Diefenderfer
State = Massachusettes

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Susan Hoglund
State = Wisconsin
Email Address = susanhoglund(a)vahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = elaine Andrews
State, = Maryland
Email Address = eekandrews@verizon.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Vanessa Kennedy
State = FL
Email Address = vmkennedy@mchsi.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Penney Margeotes
Email Address = intuitiveinsight@comcast.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Adah Schlectman
State = New York
Email Address = adahschlectman@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Sheila Mattia
State = NY
Email Address = sheilamoran@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Mrs. Kristine Kibbee
State = Washington
Email Address = twofrenchies@hotmail,com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Anna Beatty
State = Wisconsin
Email Address = beatty@tm.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jody Hill
State = Nebraska
Email Address = jahl0251@cox.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Barb Hamer
State = NY
Email Address = Barbieb222@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Lesley Mendenhall
State = Utah

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = cynthia diaz-tipton
State = michigan
Email Address = cen59086(a)hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Kim Tara
State = California
Email Address = banditl0052000@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Helen Kolbe
State = Maryland (born and raised in Pennsylvania)
Email Address = hkkolbe@comcast.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Karen Suson
State = Colorado
Email Address = sashagirllO@comcast.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Nancy Milligan
State = Indiana
Email Address = nmilligan915@comcast.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Alyssa
State = TN
Email Address = acarlson7@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Laura San Luis Penney
State = New Jersey
Email Address = lslx@bellatlantic.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Barbara Potts-Szoke
State = Mississippi
Email Address = mombjpx3@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Van Papier
State = New Jersey
Email Address = vpapier@optonline.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Michelle Sabo
State = New Jersey
Email Address = msabo(a)ccllabel.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = barbara sachau
State = 15 elm st florham park nj 07932
Email Address = jeanpublic@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Charlene McCann
State = New York
Email Address = cmccannl(5)stnv.rr.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Candi Ausman
State = CA
Email Address = crausman@wildmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Denise O'Brien
State = New Jersey
Email Address = dobdesiqn(5)hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Thomas J. Schnurr
Email Address = schnurrt@bellsouth.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Cindy Theel
State = KS
Email Address = cindvtheel(a)sbcqlobal.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Abby houlette
State = Ohio
Email Address = jeeps4wd22@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Carrie Corboy
State = NJ
Email Address = ccorbov(a)verizon.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = katrina taylor
State = nj
Email Address = ktaylor654@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Linda Mahoney
State = New Jersey
Email Address = Mahonev808(a)aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Meagan Baalman
State = Colorado
Email Address = meagan_baalman@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Kara Hoglund
State = Missouri
Email Address = kalarabeQ2(a)vahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Karen Boccadoro
State = Connecticut

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Shelley Bankert
State = Arizona
Email Address = Softailshellev(5)cox.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Becky Kocourek
State = Iowa
Email Address = beckykocourek@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Anne Marie Rogers
State = TX
Email Address = baboom(a)houston.rr.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = maria martoni
State = Connecticut
Email Address = mmartoni@alliedphone.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Betty Joyce Willis
State = MS
Email Address = betwill6(5)aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Bernadine Zamuria
State = PA
Email Address = wzamuria@comcast.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Darlene Wright
State = Texas
Email Address = rkwtwo@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Dolores Matthys
Email Address = kleinedoke@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Sherrie Strauss
State = Maryland
Email Address = sherriestraussfcDcomcast.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = cathy trauernicht
State = maryland
Email Address = cwtrau@verizon.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Prudence Hulett
State = WA
Email Address = runner@ywave.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Scott Burns
State = Kansas

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Marjorie Nurnberg
State = North Carolina
Email Address = mnurnberq(5)nc.rr.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Robyn White
State = NJ
Email Address = lwnmwrmn@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jean Schnurr
State = Maryland
Email Address = brinqiton(5)cavtel.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Robert Carlucci
State = New York
Email Address = gohonzon@optonline.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Todd Izydorski
State = Maryland
Email Address = astronauttodd(5)hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Rachel
State = New Jersey
Email Address = Ravchull80(a)aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = A.Jeanne Clegg
State = Washington
Email Address = grandmajeanne@comcast.net

Message = 1 support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Mark and Dawn Allerheiligen
Email Address = dan-mar(a)diodecom.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Sarah Houston
State = Kansas
Email Address = shouie@earthlink.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Jeni Hogenson
State = Washington
Email Address = wizfish37-media(a>yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Cristine Cowan
State = New York
Email Address = ravinfire(a)aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Reni Neuber
State = New Jersey
Email Address = Rhneuber@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = katie daly
State = CT
Email Address = katie.daly@bain.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Katie Brown
State = Texas
Email Address = ktb_24@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Julie Brown
State = Texas
Email Address = chic_ity_chic@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Nancy Brown
State = Texas
Email Address = nancybrown_234@hotmail.com

Message = 1 support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Cathryn Brown
State = Texas
Email Address = cbrown3@houstonisd.org

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Leslie Montgomery
State = Wyoming
Email Address = lmontgomerv(5)ccmc-net.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Virginia L. Martin
State = Minnesota
Email Address = martil37@tc.umn.edu

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Rosemary Rowlands
State = New Jersey
Email Address = rrowlands(5)msn.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Lauren Ramenofsky
State = California
Email Address = Buffmoml@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Laura San Luis
State = New York
Email Address = lslx@bellatlantic.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Melanie Spinney
State = Maine
Email Address = melanies@maine.rr.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Melanie Brulotte
State = Maine
Email Address = melaniebrulotte@hotmail.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Hilaria R. Weber
State = Maryland
Email Address = dObelady@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Lucy Calvachio
State = New York
Email Address = Iuc4259@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Shawndra L Michell
State = Washington
Email Address = pebbleshd(5)vahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Laura Gagel
State = NC
Email Address = zergel@charter.net

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = cindy tucker
State = north Carolina
Email Address = cindytucker@coldwellbanker.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = sam ginoni
State = florida
Email Address = miamisammyl9@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = LIZ
State = pa
Email Address = acmechoffice2@aol.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = avery
State = pa
Email Address = acmechanical@aol.com
Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you



Name = Tracey Reed
State = Kansas
Email Address = whatifanew@yahoo.com

Message = I support the changes to the commercial dog
regulations submitted by the Coalition Against Misery. The draft
regulations that were recently released by the Pennsylvania
Department of Agriculture do not adequately address the issues of
temperature control, cage conditions and humane breeding
practices.

Every kennel must be required to have a visible, safe source of heat
and air-conditioning. Additionally, the regulations should limit the
number of dogs that can be kept in one cage. And finally, we ask
that you include breeding regulations consistent with those
established by reputable breed clubs.

Please take steps to ensure that the new regulations provide
humane conditions for the dogs.

Thank you


